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Objective  : students are expected to be able to:  

• Understand fundamental concepts and principles of management, including the basic 
roles, skills, and functions of management.  

• Be knowledgeable of various theories, principles,  process of Management .  
• Be familiar with interactions between the planning , controlling ,and quality control  

in organizations  
• Be aware of the ethical dilemmas faced by managers and the social responsibilities of 

organisation.  

 

UNIT I          10 
Introduction to Management : 

Concepts of Management and organization- nature, importance ,scope and Functions of 
Management, Taylor’s Scientific Management Theory, Fayol’s Principles of Management, 
Mayo’s Hawthorne Experiments, Maslow’s Theory of Human Needs, , Herzberg’s Two-
Factor Theory of Motivation, Systems Approach to Management and social responsibility. 

 
UNIT II  

Planning and decision making        08 
 
Nature, Scope, Objectives and Significance of Planning,  strategic planning process,Types of 
Planning, Process of Planning, Barriers to Effective Planning, Planning Premises and 
Forecasting, Key to Planning, Decision Making. Group Decision Making Techniques: Brain 
Storming, Delphi, Nominal Group Technique, Lotus Blossom Technique 

 
Unit III  

Designing Organizational Structures :       10 
Basic concepts related to Organisation - Departmentation and Decentralisation, Types of 
mechanistic and organic structures of organisation (Line organization, Line and staff 
organization, functional organization, Committee organization, matrix organization, Virtual 
Organisation, Cellular Organisation, team structure, boundary less organization, inverted 
pyramid structure, lean and flat organization structure) and their merits, demerits and 
suitability. 



  
Unit –IV    

Leadership and Controlling        08 

Leading: recognition of human factor, motivation models/approaches leadership 
styles/behaviors, personal characteristics of effective leaders, leadership development, 
leadership for learning organizations, Managerial Grid – Communication Process types and 
barrier. Controlling: Control process, types-Problems, Requisites of Good Control System. 

Unit V 

Management control and quality control        12 
 
Managerial ethics and social responsibility: management control–concept and process, 
overview of control techniques, effective control system, Types of control, Method : Pre-
control - Concurrent control - Post control, an Integrated Control System, Concept of Quality, 
Factors affecting Quality, Developing a Quality Control system - Pre-control of inputs, 
Concurrent control of operations, Post control of outputs. Factors affecting ethical choices 
ethical dilemma social responsibility evaluating corporate social performance managing 
company ethics . 
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